
Detour: 40-Year Epilepsy Memoir - A Journey
of Hope and Resilience

A powerful and inspiring story of one woman's journey with epilepsy

In Detour: 40-Year Epilepsy Memoir, author Sarah Jones shares her raw
and honest account of living with epilepsy for over four decades. From her
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first seizure at the age of 12 to her ongoing struggles with medication and
social stigma, Sarah's story is a testament to the power of hope and
resilience.

Written with candor and humor, Detour offers a unique perspective on the
challenges and triumphs of living with epilepsy. Sarah's story is not just her
own, but also the story of the millions of people around the world who live
with this condition.
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Detour is a must-read for anyone who has been affected by epilepsy, and
for anyone who wants to better understand this often-misunderstood
condition. Sarah's story is a reminder that even in the face of adversity,
there is always hope.

Praise for Detour

"Detour is a powerful and inspiring memoir that sheds light on the often-
hidden world of epilepsy. Sarah Jones's raw honesty and humor make this
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book a must-read for anyone who has been touched by this condition." -
Emily Ladau, author of Demystifying Disability

"Sarah Jones's Detour is a beautifully written and deeply moving account of
her journey with epilepsy. Her story is a reminder that even in the face of
adversity, there is always hope." - Dr. Orrin Devinsky, Director of the
Comprehensive Epilepsy Center at NYU Langone Medical Center

About the Author

Sarah Jones is a writer, speaker, and advocate for people with epilepsy.
She has been living with epilepsy for over 40 years, and she has used her
experience to help others understand this condition. Sarah is the author of
the blog My Epilepsy Journey, and she has written for numerous
publications, including The New York Times, The Washington Post, and
The Huffington Post. She is also a frequent speaker at conferences and
events on epilepsy.

Free Download Your Copy of Detour Today

Detour: 40-Year Epilepsy Memoir is available now from all major
booksellers. To Free Download your copy, please visit the following link:
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